
Writing the Editor's Page is not 
always an easy task. I have 

struggled with this column more than 
most. The title for this quarter's col­
umn came wrapped in a fortune cook­
ie. The reading list came from my 
bookcase, and the text between has 
been learned the hard way. 

Several years ago I first heard the 
phrase "inclusive language." General­
ly it means written or spoken words 
that are selected to include all readers 
or listeners. The English rule I was 
taught in school on the use of the gen­
der pronouns (him, her, she, he) was to 
always use male pronouns when in 
doubt. Today we alternate female and 
male pronouns, unless a specific per­
son is being referred to. This is done to 
include both women and men in the 
discussion. Inclusive language also 
rna} be ethnically or religiously inclu­
sive. 

The Society of Nuclear Medicine 
strives to be an inclusive organization, 
serving the needs of all nuclear medi­
cine professionals-physicians, scien­
tists and technologists. In addition, the 
councils serve special interest groups 
such as computer and instrumentation, 
brain, cardiovascular, pediatrics and 
other topical interests of the member­
ship. 

The Manpower Data Survey (I) 

gave us the most recent snapshot of the 
demographics of the Technologist 
Section. Although 46% of all technol­
ogists are men, women outnumber 
men four to one on the National Coun­
cil. The first eight presidents of the 
Technologist Section were men and 
there have been eighteen male presi­
dents altogether. Why are there so few 
men in leadership positions within the 
Technologist Section today? 

National elections are also some­
what disturbing. Only about 15% of 
the membership votes in national 
Technologist Section elections. How 
can we include more Technologist 
Section members in the process of 
selecting our leaders? 

Striving to keep any organization 
inclusive can be hard work. It is cer-
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tainly easier if the membership and 
leadership are all alike, to the exclu­
sion others. Although there is less con­
flict to deal with, the group is likely to 
become stagnant or worse. The great­
est asset of an inclusive organization is 
the wide range of experience, ideas 
and talent that comes with all those 
members. 

How a group deals with conflict is 
important. Conflict can be positive. 
This is hard to remember when I am 
trying to convince someone of my 
opinion. We are so concerned about 
what we are saying, we forget to listen 
to others. Sometimes the volume 
becomes loud or the tone high-pitched 
when we try even harder to be heard. 
Repeating is another symptom that we 
are trying to make our opinion heard. 
But how many of us listen to repeat­
ed loud high-pitched opinions of oth­
ers'? It is interesting that I often learn 
the most in times of conflict. Other 
people have had different experiences 
and their perspectives are outside of 
my own experience. I never would 
have thought about the issue in just 
that same way, and I end up learning 
something in the process. 

A group will always come up with 
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a better solution than one person could 
alone. Diversity is our greatest 
strength. Most of us need to learn bet­
ter conflict resolution skills. We need 
to be able to get all of the ideas, issues, 
needs and interests out on the table for 
discussion and resolution. 

Another value of inclusive groups 
is consensus building. The problem 
with majority rules processes is that 
they result in winners and losers. The 
losers may not support the group's 
decision and may undermine it. Build­
ing consensus among group members 
results in a decision that all members 
can support. Each member's viewpoint 
is respected and valued in consensus 
building. Consensus is not always pos­
sible, especially as the group gets larg­
er or when opinions have become 
hardened in opposite directions. Con­
sensus should always be the goal, 
however. 

As the Technologist Section con­
siders the future, whether it be strate­
gic planning by the leadership or 
restructuring the Technologist Section 
by the membership, I hope we all lis­
ten to one another and seek consensus. 
I hope that I remember the advice I 
found in a fortune cookie the next time 
I am a conflict participant. Strong and 
bitter words indicate a weak cause. 
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